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1224 Lincoln St. Columbia, SC 29201
(803) 252-3613• www.cityartonline.com

art supplies • framing • gallery
artist classes • reception hall rentaltles will be sold via silent auction on Sept. 

2nd at the Chapin Labor Day Festival. The  
public will be able to bid on the turtles even 
if not present. A portion of the proceeds 
from the sale of each turtle will be  given 
to the artist and the remaining portion used 
to produce future community art projects  
planned by the League. 
      This project, combined with the 2024 
Chapin Labor Day Festival, highlights how 
a vibrant  community utilizes public events 
and public art to increase the quality of life 
for the entire  citizenry. CCAL will have a 
booth with additional information and fun 
activities in downtown  Chapin during the 
Labor Day Festival on Sept. 2. Members of 
the public are invited to  participate in the 
project through: 
- Completing the community Scavenger 

Hunt featuring the turtles (successful  
participants will be eligible for a prize draw-
ing). 
- Voting for a People’s Choice winner. 
- Purchasing one of the turtles by bidding in 
the silent auction. 
      Generous grant funding from the Central 
Carolina Community Foundation and the 
South  Carolina Arts Commission helped to 
make this project possible. The project also 
could not have been undertaken without the 
outstanding support of the local business 
community.  
      CCAL welcomes your support in con-
tinuing to make a difference for the artists 
and art in our  community. We are actively 
seeking the help of the local business com-
munity to provide  sponsorship and donated 

prizes to be used for winners of the Scaven-
ger Hunt drawing. We see this project as a 
prime opportunity to promote the partner-
ship between local business and the arts in 
our community while providing positive 
public exposure for Chapin. We invite  you 
to join CCAL members and others from the 
community in supporting the growth of the 
visual  arts in the Lake Murray region. 
     Crooked Creek Art League (CCAL) is 
located in Chapin, SC. Its more than 150  
members, from Chapin and the surrounding 
communities, include painters of all medi-
ums, photographers, sculptors and mixed 
media artists. All are welcome. CCAL is  
chartered as a charitable organization under 
Section 501(c)(3) of federal tax law. As a 
dynamic non-profit organization, CCAL 
depends on its members, business partners 
and  donors to help it continue to grow 
the visual arts in our area in many varied 
ways. The league  provides on-location art 
exhibits at local businesses, associate juror 
training and workshops. It also hosts one of 
the largest juried art shows in the midlands 

each year. Founded in 1995, the mission 
of the Crooked Creek Art League has been 
to grow awareness of the visual arts in our  
communities while providing inspiration 
and recognition for existing and aspiring 
artists. Learn more at (CrookedCreekArt.
org) and follow us on Facebook and Insta-
gram @crookedcreekartleague. 
     For more information, visit (crooked-
creekart.org/art-trail-project) or contact 
us by e-mail at (crookedcreekartleague@
gmail.com).
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